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     New apartments with excellent
communal areas, located in

Benidorm, in a pr...
 

Spain, Costa Blanca

Price:   € 800 000
Object type Apartment

Market New building

Bedrooms 3

Area 325 m2

Category For sale

    

  New apartments with excellent communal areas, located in Benidorm, in a privileged area next to "Las Rejas
Golf," just 1 km from Poniente Beach,where you can enjoy the sea, golf, and Benidorm lifestyle all in one.A
unique tower with a variety of housing options to choose from, including 1, 2, 3, and 4-bedroom apartments,
each with a parking space and spacious glass balconies offering greater brightness and views from your
home.In addition, the development includes magnificent communal areas spanning 5,400 square meters, with
adult and children's pools, 2 Jacuzzis, a playground, equipped gym, paddle tennis court, multi-sport court, green
areas, and several bicycle parking zones.Delivery: November 2024Located in Benidorm, Benidorm is one of the
most important and well-known tourist destinations in the Mediterranean. It is characterised by the quality and
cleanliness of its beaches, a privileged microclimate and a multitude of activities to enjoy at any time: theme
parks, shops of all kinds, nightlife, hiking... It is also known as the "New York of the Mediterranean" thanks to the
large number of skyscrapers that make up the city.In addition to enjoying a dream climate, Benidorm has
numerous points of interest, the island of Benidorm (or island of journalists), the Sierra Helada natural park, or
the viewpoint (better known as the castle of Benidorm), are some of the most emblematic places of the city.Not
forgetting, of course, the beaches of Poniente beach, Levante beach and the Mal Pas cove, which are one of
Benidorm's main attractions. Levante and Poniente are two of Benidorm's majestic beaches of fine sand, perfect
for enjoying a sun and beach holiday. In addition, the promenade has numerous restaurants and shops to
satisfy all the needs of the city's tourists.In addition, Alicante airport is just 40 minutes away.On the other hand,
the wide variety of leisure activities makes the town one of the most popular. The theme park Terra Mítica, the
water parks Aqualandia or Aqua Natura, the exotic animal parks such as Mundomar or Terra Natura, and an
infinity of water sports that you can practice are just some of the options that Benidorm offers. In addition, there
is a wide variety of cultural offerings and a wide range of nightlife.For more information, please do not hesitate
to contact us! Our managers are always glad to assist you during the whole process of buying your new home in
Spain!
  

Contacts:

Darja Kovalenok
GSM: + 371 26595522
(Viber, WatsApp)
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E-mail: daria@mgroup.lv
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